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by Dennis Aubuchon  

This article is about an organization that has created a 
mechanism to provide support to our military personnel. The 
organization is called www.AnySoldier.com. It is an 
organization to support our troops and give them 
encouragement. This organization and the people involved 
with it should be highly respected. The news coverage of 
events in Iraq as an example does not always provide the 
positive aspects. Some organizations seem to constantly 
have a negative perspective on the situation in Iraq. Those 
who serve us in Iraq and the rest of the world should be 
given the encouragement that we support their mission and 
appreciate their sacrifice. Being away from family and 
friends in a distant country is not an easy task to bear but 
our troops do it everyday.  
Those in our country have a right to their opinion under the 
guarantee of free speech. However the type of coverage 
received in the news about Iraq and other events does not 
necessarily provide an accurate picture of the true situation 
in Iraq. While some coverage of this nature may not be on 
purpose, our troops need to hear that the positive things 
they are accomplishing are given ample coverage. Our 
troops also need an avenue to provide some of the positive 
things taking place everyday. This site www.anysoldier.com 
provides such a resource.  
This site is for any military person who is making the 
sacrifice to keep us safe at home in the United States. There 
is a wealth of information provided such as to what our 
soldiers want and need which sometimes is not easily 
obtained. Our government furnishes clothing, equipment, 
training and other items that are necessary to keep our 
soldiers safe. Our soldiers need letters of encouragement to 
let them know that we appreciate their sacrifices. Letters 
can mean more than you know when you are far away from 
home. There is information on this site which provides 
contact points to distribute letters and packages to any 
soldier. There are also pictures of positive situations taking 
place daily. Many of the focal points provide pictures and 
what is happening in their units. This is the kind of 
information that should be distributed more widely. .  
I am not sure how I found this site but I am happy I did. 
Those reading this article can find a link to this site and the 
information through my web site 
http://www.myqualitywriting.com/AmericanHeroes.html Our 
soldiers need all the support that we can give them. It does 
not matter whether we agree or disagree with the conflict in 
Iraq or other places. We should support all our troops no 
matter where they are serving.  
In summary this site and the information and service it 
performs has received publicity in the past but I felt it 
needed all the exposure it can get. The information provided 
on the site lets you know the positive things that are 
happening in Iraq and other places. This kind of information 
deserves more exposure than it gets. This organization was 
started to support one unit but it developed to support any 
unit from any military service in harm's way. Check out the 
site and you will see how important this organization is and 
the positive impact it has on our military serving us 
everywhere.  
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